
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 24, 2021 Local Local Local Local
For:        SAFD – Annual Contract for Fire-EMS Vehicle 

Collision Body Repair Services
Superior Collision Center Carman Int Inc, dba 

Collision San Antonio
Star Collision Repair Texas JAC, dba Soutwest 

Paint & Body

CD 8994 Broadway St. 111 Braniff 5710 Kenwick St. 12500 Nacogdoches Rd.

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio, TX                 
78217

San Antonio, TX      
78216
(210) 779-9000

San Antonio, TX                   
78238

San Antonio, TX                     
78217

1A CHEVROLET PARTS AND MATERIALS
Percent of Discount Offered Less Estimating 
Guide Rate for Materials

5% CCC One 5% Mitchell 2% CCC One No Bid

A. Percent of discount offered 5% 5% 5%
B. Product Identification (Manufacturer) Motorcraft, Mopar, AC 

Delco
GM

C. Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Dealer Dealer
D. Price schedule number N/A
E. Date of price schedule 2/23/21 N/A
F. Price schedule column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)

Distributor Wholesale

2A DODGE PARTS AND MATERIALS
Percent of Discount Offered Less Estimating 
Guide Rate for Materials

5% CCC One 5% Parts 2% CCC One No Bid

A. Percent of discount offered 5% 5% 5%
B. Product Identification (Manufacturer) Mopar Dodge
C. Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Dealer Dealer
D. Price schedule number N/A
E. Date of price schedule 2/23/2021 N/A
F. Price schedule column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)

Distributor Wholesale

3A FORD PARTS AND MATERIALS
Percent of Discount Offered Less Estimating 
Guide Rate for Materials

5% CCC One 5% Mitchell 2% CCC One No Bid

A. Percent of discount offered 5% 5% 5%
B. Product Identification (Manufacturer) Motorcraft Ford
C. Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Dealer Dealer
D. Price schedule number N/A
E. Date of price schedule 2/23/2021 N/A
F. Price schedule column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)

Distributor Wholesale

4 LABOR RATE FOR SERVICE
A. Body Work Labor Rate per Hour 624 $32.00 $48.00 $36.00 $40.00
Extended Total (Estimated 624 annual hours) $19,968.00 $29,952.00 $22,464.00 $24,960.00
B. Paint Work Labor Rate per Hour 114 $32.00 $48.00 $36.00 $40.00
Extended Total (Estimated 114 annual hours) $3,648.00 $5,472.00 $4,104.00 $4,560.00
C. Expedited Repairs Labor Rate 114 $32.00 $48.00 $36.00 $40.00
Extended Total (Estimated 114 annual hours) $3,648.00 $5,472.00 $4,104.00 $4,560.00

Labor Total $27,264.00 $40,896.00 $30,672.00 $34,080.00
Labor Total with Prompt Pay Discount $27,264.00 $38,851.20 $30,058.56 $34,080.00

Total Parts $52,390.36 $41,890.39 $55,123.22 No Bid
Parts Total with Prompt Pay Discount $52,390.36 $39,795.87 $54,020.75 No Bid

Payment Terms Net 30 5% 15 Days 2% 15 Days Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $37,314.54 $39,229.07 $39,643.44 Incomplete
Estimated Annual Award $37,314.54

6100013708
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